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Guide to Submitting a 239 Application Form 

1. Start an application 
To start a new application for referral to the 
County, select from one of the two links to load 
the Planning Application form.  
 
Oneida County 
https://lfweb.ocgov.net/Forms/Oneida239  
 
Herkimer County 
https://lfweb.ocgov.net/Forms/Herkimer239Form  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
2. Criteria 

A 239 application form is only needed if your 
project meets at least one of the criteria listed. 
Check all that apply if there is more than one. 

 
 
 

3. County  
The County is automatically filled in depending 
on the link selected in Step 1. A drop-down 
menu is used to select the Municipality where 
the action is taking place, the Legislator’s name 
and the referring body (i.e. PB, ZBA). 

 
 
 

 
4. Applicant  

The Applicant Name is the name of the 
person/business applying for a zoning permit.  
Add the primary Municipal Contact, Phone 
Number and Email Address as the point of 
contact for this application. The email entered 
will be the one where all digital responses will 
be sent such as the referral letter and notice of 
final action. 
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5. Project Information  

Provide a street address in the project location 
box, if one is available.  Fill in the tax map 
number(s) where the project is located and 
provide the existing zoning classification.  In the 
proposed action box, please provide a brief 
description of the project. 

 
 
 
 
 
 

6. Type of Referral  
Check the box(es) of the type of referral being 
applied. If you choose “Other”, please describe 
the action in the box. 
 
Based on the type of referral checked, you will 
be prompted for enclosures with an upload 
button.  Files can be “uploaded” or “dragged & 
dropped” into the form window. These are the 
site plan, SEQR form, map, description, etc. 

 
 
 
 

7. Other involved agencies  
Check all agencies that will review the 
application.  If you select the “Other” option, 
type the name of the agency in the box. 

 
 
 
 

8. Additional Information  
Use this box to provide any additional 
information about the project that would be 
helpful to the reviewers. 
 
The contact listed for the municipality will 
receive an email within 30 days with a zip file 
with the recommendation letter and notice of 
final action letter. 

 

 
 

 

 
 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 
 

  


